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This book captures the importance of public 
health policy, among other critical issues, 
in selecting the more effective vaccine bet-
ween inactivated polio vaccine (IPV) and 
oral polio vaccine (OPV), currently availa-
ble across the world, for establishing vac-
cine equity in the global population to 
completely eradicate poliomyelitis that 
primarily occurs in children less than five 
years of age. The timeline for disease eradi-
cation must be stringent and the policy-
makers must honour this to save every 
child from contracting the poliovirus in a 
strict timeframe; as the authors mention in 
the book, ‘A goal without a deadline is just 
a dream’. 
 The initial goal of polio eradication was 
set in 1988 to gift a polio-free world to the 
children of the 21st century. Eradication 
was to be achieved in 2000. As of 2020, the 
goal set for 2000 has not yet been achieved, 
according to the authors. According to G. K. 
Chesterton, ‘In truth, there are only two 
kinds of people; those who accept dogma 
and know it, and those who accept dogma 
and don’t know it.’ The authors address 
the importance of paradigm shift in science 
that lets researchers explore an alternative 
approach that may not be accepted by a 
group of influential vaccine investigators, 
in spite of evidence-based observations, in 
favour of the not-so-popular approach for 
disease eradication. The authors point out 
that instead of repeating the same experi-
ment to get the best results, one might consi-
der a different approach for a better outcome. 
Thus, the book focuses on changing the 
current emphasis on using OPV to vacci-
nate populations across many geographical 

regions in the world, as opposed to using 
IPV for the rapid eradication of poliomyeli-
tis. The key roles of policymakers in the 
healthcare sector and major organizations 
such as the World Health Organization 
(WHO), policy landmarks and major his-
torical events are adequately described in 
the book. Importantly, the authors include a 
number of critical real-world observations in 
support of their notion of using IPV instead 
of OPV in vaccinating children. First, they 
use an analogy where typhoid vaccine Ty21 
A, that is a live attenuated vaccine, like 
OPV, did well in some regions of the world, 
such as in the Americas, but performed 
poorly in the Eastern Mediterranean Region. 
Rotavirus vaccine did well in the Americas, 
but not in Africa. Thus, according to the 
authors, some orally administered live, atte-
nuated vaccines were ineffective in pre-
venting diseases in many geographical 
areas. Second, the authors challenge the 
current dogma that supports the use of OPV 
as the most effective vaccine against polio-
virus, delivered orally to children, in contrast 
to IPV administration through injection. 
Typically, OPV is preferred over IPV by 
many clinicians, as they think that the po-
liovirus enters the body through the mouth 
by eating food contaminated with faeces 
and/or food prepared using unhygienic water, 
hands and kitchen utensils. Thus, the popu-
lar dogma is that oral delivery of polio 
vaccine may be effective in establishing 
intestinal–mucosal immunity in children, 
unlike in the case of IPV that is delivered 
through injection. Third, in favour of their 
argument, the authors comment that polio 
was a major problem in the USA despite 
of all care taken to sustain sanitation and 
hygiene. Also, they mention that the fast-
est natural transmission of poliovirus hap-
pens primarily in breastfeeding infants, 
which rules out the possibility of children 
contracting the poliovirus through faecal 
contamination. Thus, according to the au-
thors, airborne transmission may be the 
most likely cause of poliovirus dissemina-
tion instead of transmission through the 
mouth by eating contaminated food, which 
supports the use of IPV as opposed to OPV 
for the effective prevention of poliomyeli-
tis in children. Lastly, the authors mention 
that the manufacturing cost of OPV is 
higher than IPV, and that number of doses 
required for OPV is often higher than IPV. 
Moreover, the effectiveness of OPV is not 
that high to be preferred over IPV. Taken 
together, the authors try to address the 
purpose of this book: To advocate for a 
paradigm shift from transmission of po-

liovirus through the mouth by eating con-
taminated food to nostril administration of 
the virus by airborne transmission. This 
important paradigm shift will enable the 
policymakers to accept evidence and reject 
dogma to adopt the extensive use of IPV 
as the most effective and safest means of 
poliovirus administration to children.  
 The book is clearly written as a science 
story. It is engaging and well articulated. 
The authors’ perspectives are supported by 
real-world evidence and enough emphasis 
is given to the health policy that might fur-
ther help eradicate the poliovirus from the 
world. Considering the fact that it is chal-
lenging to come up with a different set of 
arguments against a popular dogma and let 
the readers have opposing views, a subtle 
writing tone would have helped the readers, 
including policymakers, to read the entire 
book enthusiastically. In addition, through-
out the book, the phrase ‘oral live polio 
vaccine’ is used instead of ‘live attenuated 
oral vaccine’. Moreover, it is not indicated 
why live attenuated polio vaccine requires 
more doses compared to IPV. Sometimes, 
50% efficacy is good enough to be quali-
fied as a vaccine candidate. Thus, disquali-
fication of OPV as a good vaccine candidate 
due to its less than 100% efficacy may not 
be appealing to the readers and/or critiques. 
The Cutter incident in the USA, where 
IPV administration to children resulted in 
many deaths due to improper inactivation 
of the poliovirus, is not mentioned in the 
book. A few more technical details about 
the vaccine would have helped in improv-
ing the readability, and make the authors’ 
arguments and logistical inputs in favour of 
using IPV stronger. Lastly, it is understand-
able that technical details and comparisons 
between technology platforms that are used 
to manufacture IPV and OPV are carefully 
omitted for easy reading of the book.  
 Overall the authors achieve predefined 
goals and purpose of the book. It is rele-
vant in the sense that currently the world is 
going through the devastating periodic 
spells of the COVID-19 pandemic, and it 
is important to strategize the appropriate 
vaccine policy and its distribution to the 
remotest corners of the world to achieve 
herd immunity in the global population. 
Readers will probably enjoy the compre-
hensive updates on major vaccine policy 
organizations and their bodies across the 
world that will further help them develop 
confidence about the effectiveness of vacci-
nes against infectious diseases. Importantly, 
one of the COVID-19 vaccines used curren-
tly in India, viz. Covaxin is an inactivated 
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viral vaccine like IPV. Thus, the emphasis 
on IPV in this book can boost the indige-
nous Covaxin uptake by the Indian popula-
tion. Also, the book will help readers 
understand that it is difficult to eradicate 
any pandemic completely in a reasonable 
time frame. So, patience is the key to alle-
viating anxiety among common people. 
Having said that, appropriate selection of 

vaccine type(s), based on real-world evi-
dence, during any ongoing pandemic and 
its distribution by empowering and influ-
encing policy leaders with science-based 
evidence as opposed to personal views will 
facilitate the speedy and timely eradication 
of any pandemic under a fixed deadline. 
Thus, in many ways, this book serves its 
relevance. It is an excellent book to read as 

a science story, especially for the vaccine 
policymakers.  
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